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County of Roanoke 
Finance Department - Purchasing Division 

Dawn Rago, Buyer 
Office Address: 5204 Bernard Drive Suite 300-F I Roanoke, Virginia I 24018 

Mail Address: P O Box 29800 I Roanoke, Virginia I 24018-0798 
(540) 283-8150 I drago@roanokecountyva.gov 

IFB #2020-004 Towing Services 
Bid Tab - July 31, 2020 at 2:00 PM 

Light 

Vendor 

Roanoke Towing $50.00 per hour 

Mitchells $40.00 per hour 

Woods Towing $75.00 

Strong Arm $80.00 

Brown & Sons $75.00 

Fat Boy Wrecker $84.50 

G&J Towing $65.00 

Medium 

No Bid 

No Bid 
~ 

$125.00 

No Bid 

$185.00 

$130.00 

$120.00 

Heavy 

No Bid 

No Bid 
... ·- "~ 

$200.00 

No Bid 

$225.00 

$215.00 

$220.00 


