
County of Roanoke 
Finance Department - Purchasing Division 

Dawn Rago, Buyer 
Office Address: 5204 Bernard Drive Suite 300-F I Roanoke, Virginia I 24018 

Mail Address: PO Box 29800 I Roanoke, Virginia 124018-0798 
(540) 283-8150 I drago@roanokecountyva.gov 

IFB #2021-037 Preventative Maintenance and Repairs for Overhead Doors, Exterior and Interior 

November 17, 2020 at 2:00 PM 

Door Service The Door Doctor Dominion Door 

Line Location Price Price Price 

1 Cave Spring Fire $110.00 $300.00 No Bid 

2 Catawba Fire $77.00 $400.00 No Bid 

3 Hollins Fire $140.00 $400.00 No Bid 

4 Mount Pleasant Fire $66.00 $300.00 No Bid 

5 Clearbrook Fire $88.00 $400.00 No Bid 

6 Bent Mountain Fire $77.00 $450.00 No Bid 

7 Fort Lewis Fire $120.00 $400.00 No Bid 

8 Mason Cove Fire $77.00 $400.00 No Bid 

9 Back Creek Fire $77.00 $400.00 No Bid 

10 Cave Spring Fire $44.00 $300.00 No Bid 

11 Public Service Center $120.00 $400.00 No Bid 

12 RC Fleet Service Center $110.00 $400.00 No Bid 

13 RC Public Safety Center $66.00 $200.00 No Bid 

14 North County Fire $66.00 $300.00 No Bid 

15 Western Virginia Regional Jail $154.00 $400.00 No Bid 

16 Vinton Fire $143.00 $300.00 No Bid 

I 
Regular Hourly Rate-

$50.00 $110.00 No Bid 
Overhead Doors 

Regular Hourly Rate-Exterior 
No Bid $110.00 $85.00 

Doors 

Regular Hourly Rate- Interior 
No Bid $110.00 $85.00 

Doors 

Overtime Houly Rate-
$75.00 $165.00 No Bid 

Overhead Doors 
Overtime Hourly Rate-Exterior 

No Bid $165.00 $85.00 
Doors 

Overtime Hourly Rate-Interior 
No Bid $165.00 $85.00 

Doors 

Parts Cost (% off List, etc.) 20% 0.00% 20% Off List 
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