BASE BID: PEBBLE AND TULLY/NEIL

County of Roanoke

Finance Department - Purchasing Division
Heath Honaker - Purchasing Division Director

Office Address: 5204 Bernard Drive Suite 300-F | Roanoke, Virginia | 24018
Mail Address: P O Box 29800 | Roanoke, Virginia | 24018-0798

(540) 283-8149 | khoyt@roanokecountyva.gov

IFB #2025-028 Storm Drainage Improvements
October 30, 2024

Holt Inc. Allegheny Construction Company, Inc Aaron J. Conner General Contractor, Inc. Concrete Foundations Inc. Pauleys Excavating & Demolition Inc.
PEBBLE DRIVE
Item No. Item Description UoM Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 MOBILIZATION LS 1 S 12,241.50 | $ 12,241.50 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 20,637.00 | S 20,637.00 | S 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
2 FIELD ENGINEERING LS 1 S 7,570.00 | $ 7,570.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
3 CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE LS 1 S 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 S 4,700.00 | S 4,700.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 4,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
4 WIRE/FABRIC & GRAVEL INLET PROTECTION EA 1 S 350.00 | $ 350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 S 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
5 SEED AND MULCH, INSTALLED SY 845 S 550 | S 4,647.50 $20.00 $16,900.00 S 6.00 ]S 5,070.00 | $ 6.00 ]S 5,070.00 | $ 3.00| S 2,535.00
6 TOP SOIL CY 94 S 113.00 | $ 10,622.00 $150.00 $14,100.00 S 164.00 | $ 15,416.00 | S 117.00 | $ 10,998.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 16,920.00
7 REMOVE EX. 24” CMP LF 307 S 10.00 | $ 3,070.00 $75.00 $23,025.00 S 10.00 | S 3,070.00 | $ 60.00 | S 18,420.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 13,815.00
8 INSTALL 24" RCP LF 307
FURNISHED BY RO. CO. S 194.00 | S 59,558.00 $300.00 $92,100.00 S 462.00 | $ 141,834.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 31,621.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 85,960.00
9 INSTALL STRUCTURE D-1 SHOWN ON PLANS EA 1
FURNISHED BY RO. CO. S 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 S 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00
10 REMOVE & REINSTALL CH. LNK. FENCE LF 164 S 24.00 | S 3,936.00 $240.00 $39,360.00 S 50.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 27.00 | S 4,428.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 5,740.00
11 REMOVE AND RESET EX. SHED EA 2 S 2,650.00 | $ 5,300.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 S 6,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
TOTAL PEBBLE DRIVE BID $113,295.00 $286,485.00| $ 217,540.00 | $ 123,824.00 | $ 199,970.00
AS READ BID AMOUNTS $113,295.00 $286,485.00 $217,540.00 $123,824.00 $199,970.00
Holt Inc. Allegheny Construction Company, Inc Aaron J. Conner General Contractor, Inc. Concrete Foundations Inc. Pauleys Excavating & Demolition Inc.
TULLY/NEIL DRIVE
Item No. Item Description UoM Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 MOBILIZATION LS 1 S 23,870.35 | S 23,870.35 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 67,624.00 | S 67,624.00 | $ - S -
2 FIELD ENGINEERING LS 1 S 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ - S -
3 SILT FENCE LF 229 S 6.00 | S 1,374.00 | $ 16.00 | S 3,664.00 | S 5.00 | $ 1,145.00 | $ 7.00 [ S 1,603.00 | $ - S -
4 WIRE/FABRIC & GRAVEL INLET PROTECTION EA 8 S 350.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ - S -
5 CLASS | RIP RAP W/ FABRIC SY 46 S 95.00 | $ 4,370.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 7,360.00 | S 160.00 | $ 7,360.00 | $ - S -
6 SEED AND MULCH, INSTALLED SY 436 S 18.00 | $ 7,848.00 | $ 24.00 | S 10,464.00 | S 7.00| S 3,052.00 | $ 6.00 ]S 2,616.00 | $ - S -
7 SAW CUT EX. ASPHALT LF 750 S 350 (S 2,625.00 | S 10.00 | S 7,500.00 | $ 6.00 | S 4,500.00 | $ 8.00 [ S 6,000.00 | $ - S -
8 FURNISH & INSTALL 15” CL. lll RCP LF 192 S 166.00 | $ 31,872.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 68,160.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 107,520.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 21,504.00 | $ - S -
9 FURNISH & INSTALL 18" CL. Ill RCP LF 82 S 197.00 | $ 16,154.00 | S 410.00 | $ 33,620.00 | $ 570.00 | $ 46,740.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 9,430.00 | $ - S -
10 FURNISH & INSTALL 24” CL. lll RCP LF 82 S 306.00 | $ 25,092.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 49,200.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 49,200.00 | $ 181.00 | S 14,842.00 | - S -
11 FURNISH & INSTALL 30" CL. Ill RCP LF 176 S 219.00 | $ 38,544.00 | $ 630.00 | $ 110,880.00 | S 670.00 | $ 117,920.00 | $ 206.00 | S 36,256.00 | $ - S -
12 T-DI-3 CURB INLET L=18' EA 1 S 8,450.00 | $ 8,450.00 | $ 17,600.00 | S 17,600.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 10,536.00 | S 10,536.00 | $ - S -
13 DI-3B-L=14' EA 4 S 6,817.00 | $ 27,268.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 68,000.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 8,944.00 | S 35,776.00 | $ - S -
14 DI-3B-L=10" EA 1 S 8,435.00 | S 8,435.00 [ $ 17,800.00 | $ 17,800.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 10,250.00 | $ 10,250.00 | $ - S -
15  |MH-1 EA 1 S 6,600.00 | S 6,600.00 | S 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 8,900.00 | S 8,900.00 | $ 7,617.00 | S 7,617.00 | S - S -
16 CG-6 CURB INSTALLED LF 515 S 51.00 | $ 26,265.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 46,350.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 87,550.00 | $ 50.00 | S 25,750.00 | $ - S -
17 |[CG-9B CONCRETE ENTRANCE EA 3 S 5,036.00 | $ 15,108.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 5,275.00 | $ 15,825.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ - S -
18 30" EW-1 EA 1 S 3,360.00 | S 3,360.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ - S -
19 [VDOT R/W MILL EX. ASPHALT 1.5” SY 892 S 15.00 | $ 13,380.00 | S 25.00 | $ 22,300.00 | $ 20.00 | S 17,840.00 | S 58.00 | $ 51,736.00 | $ - S -
20 VDOT R/W 1.5 SM9.5A OVERLAY TONS 82.51 S 315.00 | $ 25,990.65 | $ 540.00 | $ 44,555.40 | $ 419.00 | $ 34,571.69 | S 98.00 | $ 8,085.98 [ $ - S -
21 PRIVATE DRIVEWAY ASPHALT MILL & SURFACH SY 201 S 55.00 | $ 11,055.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 30,150.00 | $ 69.00 | S 13,869.00 | S 58.00 | $ 11,658.00 | $ - S -
22 REMOVE & REPLACE WOOD PRIVACY FENCE LF 40 S 113.00 | $ 4,520.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ - S -
23 |MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PER TTC-23.2 LS 1 S 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | S 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ - S -
TOTAL TULLY/NEIL DRIVE BID $314,581.00 $749,793.40 $647,192.69 $395,743.98 No Bid
AS READ BID AMOUNTS $314,581.00 $767,793.40 $647,192.69 $395,743.98 N/A
TOTAL BASE BID (PEBBLE AND TULLY/NEIL) $427,876.00 $1,036,278.40 $864,732.69 $519,567.98 No Bid|




AS READ BASE BID S427,876.00| $1,050,278.40 $864,732.69 5519,567.98| N/Al
ADD ALTERNATE 1
Holt Inc. Allegheny Construction Company, Inc Aaron J. Conner General Contractor, Inc. Concrete Foundations Inc. Pauleys Excavating & Demolition Inc.

CROWN ROAD

Item No. Item Description UoM Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 MOBILIZATION LS 1S 12,135.00 | $ 12,135.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 53,560.00 | $ 53,560.00 | $ S -
2 FIELD ENGINEERING LS 1[$ 1,675.00 | $ 1,675.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ S -
3 CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE EA 1S 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 4,700.00 | S 4,700.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 4,000.00 | $ S -
4 SILT FENCE LF 45( S 6.00 | S 270.00 | $ 24.00 | S 1,080.00 | $ 500 ]| S 225.00 [ $ 7.00| S 315.00 [ $ S -
5 WIRE/FABRIC & GRAVEL INLET PROTECTION EA 2| s 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ S -
6 CULVERT INLET PROTECTION EA 1$ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ S -
7 EC-3 BLANKET MATTING SF 180( S 2.00 (S 360.00 | $ 350 (S 630.00 | $ 6.00 | S 1,080.00 | $ 6.00 | S 1,080.00 | $ S -
8 DIVERSION DIKE LF 75| S 16.00 | S 1,200.00 | $ 24.00 | S 1,800.00 | S 50.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ S -
9 CLASS Al RIP RAP OUTLET PROTECTION SY 15| $ 148.00 | S 2,220.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 4,125.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 4,050.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ S -
10 TOP SOIL CcY 54| S 114.00 | $ 6,156.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 7,290.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 11,880.00 | $ 117.00 | $ 6,318.00 | $ S -
11 SEED AND MULCH, INSTALLED SY 484| S 6.00 | S 2,904.00 | $ 20.00 | S 9,680.00 | $ 6.00 | S 2,904.00 | $ 6.00 | S 2,904.00 | S S -
12 REMOVE EX. STORM DRAIN INLET EA 2|s 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 7,400.00 | $ S -
13 [REMOVE EX. 15" CMP LF 35| $ 40.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 4,725.00 | $ 60.00 | S 2,100.00 | $ S -
14 REMOVE EX. 18" CMP LF 55| $ 50.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 4,675.00 | $ 60.00 | S 3,300.00 | $ S -
15 [REMOVE EX. 24" CMP LF 142| S 44.00 | $ 6,248.00 | S 200.00 | $ 28,400.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 21,300.00 | $ 60.00 | S 8,520.00 | $ S -
16 FLOWABLE FILL IN LIEU OF PIPE REMOVAL cy 5

(INCLUDES REQUIRED CAPS/PLUGS) S 355.00 | $ 1,775.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 1,960.00 | $ 9,800.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ S -
17 |[REMOVE EX. CG-6 LF 54| S 13.00 | S 702.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 4,320.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,160.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ S -
18 REMOVE EX. STONE WALL LF UE 32.00( $ 224.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ S -
19 [SAW CUT ASPHALT LF 60| $ 10.00 | S 600.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 16.00 | S 960.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 480.00 | $ S -
20 REMOVE VDOT ROADWAY PAVEMENT SY 79| $ 11.00 | $ 869.00 | $ 60.00 | S 4,740.00 | $ 73.00 | S 5,767.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 14,220.00 | $ S -
21 REMOVE DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT SY 61| S 11.00 | S 671.00 | $ 60.00 | S 3,660.00 | S 9.00 | $ 549.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 10,980.00 | S S -
22 FURNISH & INSTALL 30" CLASS Ill RCP LF 155| $ 420.00 | $ 65,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 325,500.00 | $ 1,688.00 | $ 261,640.00 | $ 229.00 | $ 35,495.00 | $ S -
23 |DI-3C CURB INLET L=6’ EA 1S 9,725.00 | $ 9,725.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ S -
24 DI-3C CURB INLET L=16’ EA 1$ 17,270.00 | $ 17,270.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 21,060.00 | $ 21,060.00 | $ S -
25 |CG-6 CURB INSTALLED LF 54| S 100.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 4,860.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 11,880.00 | S 50.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ S -
26 30" ES-1 EA 11$ 1,990.00 | $ 1,990.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ S -
27 130" EW-1 EA 1S 7,290.00 | $ 7,290.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ S -
28 PIPE ANCHOR BLOCKS EA UE 775.00 | $ 5,425.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 17,500.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 22,400.00 | $ S -
29 |CLASS A1 RIP RAP WITH FABRIC SY 15[ S 206.00 | S 3,090.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 349.00 | $ 5,235.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ S -
30 VDOT ROADWAY PAVEMENT INSTALLED SY 79| S 80.00 | $ 6,320.00 | $ 435.00 | S 34,365.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 8,374.00 | $ 335.00 | $ 26,465.00 | $ S -
31 DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT INSTALLED SY 61| S 72.00 | S 4,392.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 12,200.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 8,052.00 | $ 335.00 | $ 20,435.00 | $ S -
32 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PER TTC-23.2 LS 1l $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ S -
TOTAL CROWN ROAD BID (ADD ALTERNATE 1) $176,261.00 $719,450.00 $491,356.00 $321,362.00 No Bid
AS READ BID AMOUNT $176,261.00 $719,450.00 $491,356.00 $321,362.00 N/A
ADD ALTERNATE 2
Holt Inc. Allegheny Construction Company, Inc Aaron J. Conner General Contractor, Inc. Concrete Foundations Inc. Pauleys Excavating & Demolition Inc.

RICHARDS BOULEVARD

Item No. Item Description UoM Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 MOBILIZATION LS 1 S 5,950.00 | $ 5,950.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 18,763.00 | $ 18,763.00 S -
2 FIELD ENGINEERING LS 1 S 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 S -
3 CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE EA 1 S 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | S 3,700.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 4,000.00 S -
4 SILT FENCE LF 45 S 6.00 | S 270.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 500 S 225.00 [ $ 7.00| S 315.00 S -
5 SILT FENCE CULVERT INLET PROTECTTION EA 1 S 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 S -
6 SILT SOCK LF 50 S 16.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 60.00 | S 3,000.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 12,500.00 S -
7 EC-3 BLANKET MATTING SF 90 S 2.00 (S 180.00 | $ 350 (S 315.00 | $ 6.00 | S 540.00 | $ 6.00 | S 540.00 S -
8 EC-1 RIP RAP SY 3 S 150.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 310.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 480.00 S -
9 SILT SACK INLET PROTECTION EA 1 S 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 450.00 S -
10 SEED AND MULCH, INSTALLED SY 611 S 580 | $ 3,543.80 | $ 20.00 | S 12,220.00 | $ 6.00 ]S 3,666.00 | $ 6.00 ]S 3,666.00 S -
11 REMOVE EX. STORM DRAIN INLET EA 1 S 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 S -
12 REMOVE EX. 15" CMP LF 211 S 16.00 | S 3,376.00 | $ 50.00 | S 10,550.00 | $ 50.00 | S 10,550.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 8,440.00 S -
13 [SAW CUT ASPHALT LF 44 S 16.00 | S 704.00 | $ 60.00 | S 2,640.00 | S 30.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 352.00 S -
14 REMOVE & REPLACE VDOT PAVEMENT SY 11 S 200.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 9,570.00 | $ 352.00 | $ 3,872.00 S -
15 INSTALL 15" CLASS Il RCP LF 207

FURNISHED BY RO. CO. S 119.00 | $ 24,633.00 | $ 230.00 | $ 47,610.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 93,150.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 10,350.00 S -




16 INSTALL DI-7, FURNISHED BY RO. CO. EA 1 S 3,100.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 4,900.00 S -
17 |[INSTALL MH-1, FURNISHED BY RO. CO. EA 1 S 3,100.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 2,600.00 | S 2,600.00 | S 4,158.00 | S 4,158.00 S -
18 INSTALL 15" ES-1, FURNISHED BY RO. CO. EA 1 S 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 S -
19 15" PIPE COLLAR AT CONNECTION TO EX. EA 1 $ 2,080.00 | $ 2,080.00 | S 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00 S -
20 REMOVE & REPLACE CHAIN LINK FENCE LF 125 S 30.80 | S 3,850.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 15,625.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 6,750.00 S -
21 24” CONCRETE GUTTER LF 128 S 74.50 | S 9,536.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 16,640.00 | S 30.00 | $ 3,840.00 S -
22 MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC PERTTC-23.2& TT( LS 1 S 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 S -
TOTAL RICHARDS BLVD BID (ADD ALTERNATE 2) $73,472.80 $203,010.00 $183,341.00 $124,826.00 No Bid
AS READ BID AMOUNT $73,472.00 $203,100.00 $183,341.00 $112,576.00 N/A
TOTALS Holt Inc. Allegheny Construction Company, Inc Aaron J. Conner General Contractor, Inc. Concrete Foundations Inc. Pauleys Excavating & Demolition Inc.
BASE BID TOTAL: $427,876.00 $1,036,278.40 $864,732.69 $519,567.98 N/A
ADD ALTERNATE 1: $176,261.00 $719,450.00 $491,356.00 $321,362.00 No Bid
ADD ALTERNATE 2: $73,472.80 $203,010.00 $183,341.00 $124,826.00 No Bid
TOTAL $677,609.80 $1,958,738.40 $1,539,429.69 $965,755.98 N/A

AS READ TOTAL

$677,609.80

$1,972,738.40

$1,539,429.69

$953,505.98

N/A




